Purchase Requisition
. Office of the Purchasing Agent

Cook County-of lllinois @M % ”Nﬁ |

e ; Buyer Number
Contract # 13Y] - 13004 [ BidiSole SrcCode  ENC

Business Unit
Delivery Instnictions:

Purchase Order Number

Requisiton# OR 109951

ShipTo: 8000458

Information Technology- Automa

0091389
Cook County Administration Off

Supplier: 773403 PKWARE inc

Internal.Req Number 13009043
Cynifila Park 312-603-1328 848 N Plankinton-Ave Ste:220 Board Apr Date & ftem
N 69'W. Washington Street Rm 270 69 W. Washington #2700 Mitwaukee Wi 53233 Requisition Date 712812013
o
One Time Purchase Yes, .No Govers:Need for months. Specific Period of time __. thra Prior Contract No, .. [Expiration:Date Emergency No.
Line# Commodity Description Bal. on'Hand Quantity . UOM mmw:g Oom_, Exterided Cost  Business Unit and Object Account
1.000 208 SecureZip Maintenance Part #SEZ19-1406-ENG-EC1 < > 1.00 YR 659.0000 659.00 0091369:540180
Maintenance:Period 8/1/2013-7/31/2014 .
Total of ftems:Ordered 659,00
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Alma Rosa (Procurement)

From: CC Procurement (Procurement)

Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2013 11:52 AM

To: Alma Rosa (Procurement)

Cc Larry Hosty (Procurement); Keyla Hopkins (MIS); Dionna Brookens (Procurement)
Subject: FW: Requisition 109951

Attachments: PKWarel.pdf

Hello Alma,

Please assign the attached requisition (ncr) to Larry Hosty. Thanks,

Ed Gronkowski

From: Keyla Hopkins (MIS)
Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2013 10:38 AM
To: CC Procurement (Procurement)
Subject: FW: Requisition 109951

May | have an update on this requisition?

From: Keyla Hopkins (MIS)

Sent: Thursday, August 01, 2013 2:32 PM
To: CC Procurement (Procurement)
Subject: Requisition 109951

Please assign the attached requisition to a buyer.

Keyla Hopkins

Bureau of Technology
69 W. Washington
Suite 2700

Chicago, Illinois 60602
312-603-1373
312-603-9905 fax



® 648 N. Plankinton Avenue
Suite 220
Milwaukee, W1 53203
www.pkware.com >
1888 4 PKWARE »
+1 414 289 9788
+1 414 289 9789 fax

DATA SECURITY & COMPRESSION

Company: Cook County Bureau of Tech Cook County Offices - (Headquarters) Cook County Offices
(Headquarters)
Name: Business Office Derrick Thomas Derrick Thomas )
Address: 69 W. Washington 69 W. Washington, 27th FLr 69 W. Washington, 27th FLr
Ste 2700 Chicago, IL 60602 Chicago, IL 60602
Chicago, IL 60602 United States United States
United States
| Phone: (312) 443-5500 3126033120 3126033120
Fax: ‘ (312) 603-9905 (312) 603-9905
E-Mail: bot.businessoffice @cookcountyil.gov derrick.thomas @cookcountyil.gov derrick thomas@cookcountyil. gov

1 SEZ19-1406-ENG-ACO | SecureZIP,WinSrv,v14,eBusiness Ed,new,server lic 1 3,295.00

3,295.00
2 SEZ19-1406-ENG-EC! | SecureZIP,WinSrv,v14,eBusiness Ed,initial maint,server lic 1 659.00 659.00
. SUBTOTAL: $3.954.00
Sales tax shall be applied to the invoice for items received in CA, ID, IL, MA, MD, NE, NY, OH, N
PA, TX, UT, VA and WI. VAT shall be applied to the invoice for UK customers. Amount Due: $3,954.00

SecureZIP,WinSrv,v14,eBusiness Ed,initial maint,server lic
20.00%
9/1/2013 — 8/31/2014

$659.00

Comments to Customer:

Terms and Conditions:

o The installation and use of the Software quoted above is governed by the applicable license agreement located at http://legal. pkware.com.

e For z/OS and i5/0S products, processor details and a serial number for each licensed machine(s) are required.

* For z/OS products, all MIPS ratings are determined by Cheryl Watson’s CPU chart.

¢ For Software installed on HP-UX, IBM-AIX, Linux for x86, or Sun Solaris server, the quantity specified above ("Qty") is the Authorized
Machine's total number of CPUs plus any virtual operating environments in which the Software is installed. For Windows Server versions of the
Software, Qty equals the total number of physical and virtual operating environments in which the Software is installed (i.e. each instance).

* Notwithstanding any contrary terms herein, for HP-UX, IBM-AIX, Linux for x86, and Sun Solaris versions of the Software known as SecureZIP
eBusiness Edition: A license is required for each physical and each virtual operating environment in which the Software is installed (i.e. each
instance). . .

¢ Any purchase order for the items quoted herein needs to reference the above quote number. Provisions, or the like, including those of any
purchase order, contrary to or in addition to the terms of the Agreement and this quote shall be void and of no effect unless both PKWARE and
End Licensee have explicitly agreed to them in writing.

e Payment terms: Net 30; Make remittance payable to PKWARE, Inc., Box 88053, Milwaukee, W1 53288-0053.

¢ The Maintenance Term will begin and end on the dates specified on the invoice. ,

¢ This quote is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity named above and contains information that is privileged or otherwise
confidential. Any review, dissemination, or use of this quote or any of its contents by anyone other than those named above is strictly prohibited.

Patrick Lynkiewicz

PKWARE
patrick.lynkiewicz@pkware.com
414.289.9788

Quote Q03330590 Page 1 of 1 ; 4/16/2013

A



® 648 N. Plankinton Avenue » ‘ .
Suite 220 .
Milwaukee, Wi 53203 ¢
www.pkware.com . . »

1 888 4 PKWARE ‘
+1 414 289 9788
+1 414 289 9789 fax

Q03330590
4/16/2013

Cook County Offices
14399

08/14/2013

DATA SECURITY & COMPRESSION

i 5.3, : ; il i Wilician, i
Company: | Cook County Bureau of Tech. ; Cook County Offices - (Headquarters) - Cook County Offices
(Headquarters)
Naine: Business Office Derrick Thomas Derrick Thomas
* Address: 69 W. Washington 69 W. Washington, 27th FLr 69 W. Washington, 27th FLr
Ste 2700 .Chicago, IL 60602 : Chicago; IL 60602
Chicago, IL 60602 United States United States
United States
Phone: (312) 443-5500 13126033120 3126033120
Fax: v (312) 603-9905 (312).603-9905
E-Mail: bot.businessoffice @cookcountyil.gov derrick thomas @cookcountyil.gov derrick thomas @cookcountyil.gov

24 I:H 3

1 | SEZ19-1406-ENG-ACO | SecureZIP,WinSrv,v14,eBusiness Ed,new,server lic 1 3,295.00 | 3,205.00
2 SEZ19-1406-ENG-EC1 | SecureZIP,WinSrv,v14,eBusiness Ed,initial maint,server lic 1 659.00 - 659.00
) SUBTOTAL: " $3,954.00
Sales tax shall be applied to the invoice for items received in CA, ID, IL, MA, MD, NE, NY, OH, : .
PA, TX, UT, VA and WI. VAT shall be applied to the invoice for UK customers. o -~ -Amott Dug:, §3,954.00

RS

SecureZIP,Werv,leBusmess d,initlal maint,server lic
20.00%
9/1/2013 - 8/31/2014

@l/a / /
l/'7/3’0/3"7//3\/3119{w

$659.00

Comments to Customer:

Terms and Conditions:
® The installation and use of the Software quoted above is governed by the applicable license agreement located at hitp://legal.pkware.com.
o For z/OS and i5/0S products, processor.details and a serial number for each licensed machine(s) are required.
e For z/0S products, all MIPS ratings are determined by Cheryl Watson’s CPU chart.
L]

For Software installed on HP-UX, IBM-AIX, Linux for x86, or Sun Solaris server, the quantity specified above ("Qty"yis the Authorized
Machine's total number of CPUs plus any virtual operating environments in which the Software is installed. For Windows Server versions of the
Software, Qty equals the total number of physical and virtual operating environments in which the Software is installed (i.e. each instance).

¢ Notwithstanding any contrary terms herein, for HP-UX, IBM-AIX, Linux for x86, and Sun Solaris versions of the Software known as SecureZIP
eBusiness Edition: A license is required for each physical and each virtual operating environment in which the Software is installed (i.e. each
instance). . . ‘

o Any purchase order for the items quoted herein needs to reference the above quote number. Provisions, or the like, including those of any
purchase order, contrary to or in addition to the terms of the Agreement and this quote shall be void and of no effect unless both PKWARE and
End Licensee have explicitly agreed to them in writing. ST

¢ Payment terms: Net 30; Make remittance payable to PKWARE, Inc., Box 88053, Milwaukee, WI 53288-0053.

¢ The Maintenance Term will begin and end on the dates specified on the invoice. : , .

This quote is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity named above and contains information that is privileged or otherwise

. confidential. Any review, dissemination, or use of this quote or any of its contents by anyone other than those named above is strictly prohibited.

Patrick Lynkiewicz

PKWARE

patrick lynkiewicz@pkware.com
414.289.9788

Quote Q03330590 ,  Pagelofl ' 4/16/2013



® 648 N. Plankinton Avenue
Suite 220 :
Milwaukee, W1 53203
www.pkware.com LT
1888 4 PKWARE ’ .
+1 414 289 9788 '
+1 414 289 9789 fax

Q03330590
4/16/2013

Cook County Offices
14399

08/14/2013

DATA SECURITY & COMPRESSION

omy.

y Cook County Offices - (Headguarters) Cook County Offices
(Headquarters)
Name: Business Office Derrick Thomas Derrick Thomas o
Address: 69 W. Washington 69 W. Washington, 27th FLr 69 W. Washington, 27th FLr
Ste 2700 .Chicago, IL 60602 " | Chicago; IL 60602
Chicago, IL 60602 United States United States
United States
Phone: (312) 443-5500 3126033120 3126033120
Fax: (312) 603-9905 (312) 603-9905
E-Mail: bot.businessoffice@cookcountyil.gov derrick.thomas @cookcountyil.gov denick.tl}omas@cookcodntyil. gov

SEZ19-1406-ENG-ACO | SecureZIP,WinSrv,v14,eBusiness Ed,new,server lic 3,295.00

1 3,295.00

2 SEZ19-1406-ENG-EC1 SecureZIP,WinS}v,v14,eBusiness Ed,initial maint,server lic 1 659.00 659.00

SUBTOTAL: ~ $3,954.00

Sales tax shall be applied to the invoice for iterné received in CA, ID, IL, MA, MD, NE, NY, OH,

Amount Due: $3,954.00

PA, TX, UT, VA and W1. VAT shall be applied to the invoice for UK customers.

SecureZIP,WinSrv,v14, eBusiness Ed,initial maint,server lic
20.00%
9/1/2013 ~ 8/31/2014

$659.00

Comments to Customer:

Terms and Conditions:

The installation and use of the Software quoted above is governed by the applicable license agreement located at http:/legal.pkware.com.

For z/OS and i5/08 products, processor details and a serial number for each licensed machine(s) are required.

For 2/0S products, all MIPS ratings are determined by Cheryl Watson’s CPU chart.

For Software installed on HP-UX, IBM-AIX, Linux for x86, or Sun Solaris server, the quantity specified above ("Qty") is the Authorized

Machine's total number of CPUs plus any virtual operating environments in which the Software is installed. For Windows Server versions of the

Software, Qty equals the total number of physical and virtual operating environments in which the Software is installed (i.e. each instance).

» Notwithstanding any contrary terms herein, for HP-UX, IBM-AIX, Linux for x86, and Sun Solaris versions of the Software known as SecureZIP
eBusiness Edition: A license is required for each physical and each virtual operating environment in which the Software is installed (i.e. each
instance). :

» Any purchase order for the items quoted herein needs to reference the above quote number. Provisions, or the like, including those of any
purchase order, contrary to or in addition to the terms of the Agreement and this quote shall be void and of no effect unless both PKWARE and
End Licensee have explicitly agreed to them in writing. -

e Payment terms: Net 30; Make remittance payable to PKWARE, Inc., Box 88053, Milwaukee, WI 53288-0053.

e The Maintenance Term will begin and end on the dates specified on the invoice.

* This quote is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity named above and contains information that is privileged or otherwise
confidential. Any review, dissemination, or use of this quote or any of its contents by anyone other than those named above is strictly prohibited.

Patrick Lynkiewicz

PKWARE
patrick.lynkiewicz@pkware.com
414.289.9788

-Quote Q03330590 Page 1 of 1 ‘ 4/16/2013



® 648 N. Plankinton Avenue
Suite 220
Mitwaukee, W1 53203 :
www.pkware.com
1 888 4 PKWARE
+1 414 289 9788
+1 414 289 9789 fax

¢ Q03330590
4/16/2013

Cook County Offices
| 14399

DATA SECURITY & COMPRESS!ON

%

bt T, 18

Company: | Cook County Bureau of Tech Cook County Offices - (Headquarters) Cock County Offices
(Headquarters) ]

Name: Business Office Derrick Thomas Derrick Thomas

- Address: 69 W. Washington 69 W. Washington, 27th FLr 69 W. Washington, 27th FLr

Ste 2700 .Chicago, IL 60602 - | Chicago, IL 60602
Chicago, IL 60602 , United States ; United States
United States _ :

Phone: (312) 443-5500 . |3126033120 3126033120

Fax: v (312) 603-9505 (312) 603-9905

E-Mail: bot.businessoffice @cookcountyil gov derrick.thomas@cookcountyil.gov denick;tl}omas@cookcotintyil.gov

pLId)

‘ SEZ19-1406-ENG-ACO SecureZIP,WinSrv,vM,eBusinss E,new,server lic » 1 3,295.00 A 3,295.00
2 SEZ19-1406-ENG-EC1 | SecureZIP,WinSrv,v14,eBusiness Ed,initial maint,server lic 1 659.00 - 659.00
. - SUBTOTAL: $3,954.00
Sales tax shall be applied to the invoice foritems received in CA, ID, IL, MA, MD, NE, NY, OH, .
PA, TX, UT, VA and WI, VAT shall be applied to the invoice for UK customers. - ~Amount Due:, , $3,954.00

SecureZIP,WinSrv,v1l
20.00% ,
7013 — 8/3120T4 ; / v ‘

f— Gl 201 4 ’ $659.00

et

Lo St pu? TICATRERE
4,eBusiness Ed,initial maint,

server lic

Comments to Customer:

Terms and Conditions:

» The installation and use of the Software quoted above is governed by the applicable license agreement located at http MNegal.pkware.com.

e For z/OS and i5/08 products, processor details and a serial number for each licensed machine(s) are required.

e For z/0S products, all MIPS ratings are determined by Cheryl Watson’s CPU chart.

o For Software installed on HP-UX, IBM-AIX, Linux for x86, or Sun Solaris server, the quantity specified above ("Qty") is the Authorized
Machine's total number of CPUs plus any virtual operating environments in which the Software is installed. For Windows Server versions of the
Software, Qty equals the total number of physical and virtual operating environments in which the Software is installed (i.e. each instance).

s Notwithstanding any contrary terms herein, for HP-UX, IBM-AIX, Linux for x86, and Sun Solaris versions of the Software known as SecureZIP
eBusiness Edition: A license is required for each physical and each virtual operating environment in which the Software is installed (i.e. each
instance). ) o

¢ Any purchase order for the items quoted herein needs to reference the above quote number. Provisions, or the like, including those of any
purchase order, contrary to or in addition to the terms of the Agreement and this quote shall be void and of no effect unless both PKWARE and
End Licensee have explicitly agreed to them in writing. -

¢ Payment terms: Net 30; Make remittance payable to PKWARE, Inc., Box 88053, Milwaunkee, WI 53288-0053.

¢ The Maintenance Term will begin and end on the dates specified on the invoice. . ,

e This quote is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity named above and contains information that is privileged or otherwise
confidential. Any review, dissemination, or use of this quote or any of its contents by anyone other than those named above is strictly prohibited.

Patrick Lynkiewicz
PKWARE

patrick Jynkiewicz@pkware.com
414.289.9788

‘Quote Q03330590 Page 1 of 1 : ’  4/16/2013



Larz Hostz (Procurement) ‘

From: John Sotos <John.Sotos@pkware.com>
Sent: Monday, September 09, 2013 1:16 PM
To: Larry Hosty (Procurement)

Cc: ‘ Dionna Brookens (Procurement)
Subject: RE: Pk software maintenance
Attachments: Cook County Offices - Q03330590.pdf
Larry,

Forwarding update PKWARE quote for Cook County to issue PO for PKWARE License and 1 year
maintenance.

Regards,

John G. Sotos
Director, Western US & Canada

PKWARE, Inc.

Mobile: 312-543-0998
www.pkware.com

SecureZIP Reader is now available on Apple® iTunes® and Google Play!

From: Larry Hosty (Procurement) [mailto:larry.hosty@cookcountyil.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, September 04, 2013 8:58 AM

To: John Sotos

Cc: Dionna Brookens (Procurement)

Subject: RE: Pk software maintenance

Hi John
Thanks for getting back to me. We would like to have an agreement with the 2 items expiring 7/31 on it for the period
08/01/2013 through 07/31/2014 @ @3295.00 for the server license and @695.00 for the maintenance. Total

$3,930.00. One agreement for signature by the County. Just the way we did it last spring.
Thank You

Larry Hosty

From: John Sotos [mailto:John.Sotos@pkware.com]
Sent: Tuesday, September 03, 2013 6:50 PM

To: Larry Hosty (Procurement)

Subject: RE: Pk software maintenance

Larry,

- Received your vmail and providing some details .



The individual Windows License and Maintenance quotes are for new purchases. PKWARE requires the first
year of maintenance to be purchased with new license.

Because Cook County is a key customer, | can request PKWARE prepare a maintenance quote for the
Server licenses from 8/1/13 to 12/31/13 ( 5 months) and prepare an annual maintenance renewal to coincide
with 2014 renewals for the Mainframe and Power boxes.

A second option would be to prepare a maintenance quote for the Server licenses from 8/1/13 to 12/31/14 (17
months).

At the end of 2014 all platforms will be on the same maintenance renewal schedule.

Please let me know if the information above answers your request.

Regards,

John G. Sotos
Director, Western US & Canada

PKWARE, Inc.
Mobile: 312-543-0998

www.pkware.com

SecureZiP Reader is now available on Apple® iTunes® and Google Play!
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From: John Sotos

Sent: Thursday, August 29, 2013 10:58 AM

To: 'Larry Hosty (Procurement)’

Cc: Cynthia Park (Bureau of Technology); Dionna Brookens (Procurement)
Subject: RE: Pk software maintenance

Larry,

Thank you for the call.

Below is a list of the PKWARE products with maintenance for Cook County.

The three items have been co-termed and next renewal is 12/31/2013.

1. PKZ08-1401-ENG-FC1 (IBM Mainframe -MIPS-205) - $8335.40
2. PKZ07-9000-ENG-FC1 (IBM Power Model 570) - $3016.68
3. PKZ07-9000-ENG-FC1 (IBM Power Model 550) - $2332.48

The new PKWARE quote is for Windows platform.

1. SEZ19-1406-ENG-ACO - Windows License - $3295
2. SEZ19-1406-ENG-EC1 - Maintenance - $948 (expires 7/31/2014)
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Good Morning John
I have requests for PO’s for maintenance of some of your software. | believe the County has several programs from your
company all with different renewal dates and prices. These should be consolidated into one contract for simplicity. For

starters could you list the products dates and prices and send them to me? So we can see what we are up against and
start from there.

Thank You
Larry Hosty
312-603-3951



- PKWARE can update the maintenance quote to expire on 12/31/2013 for new Windows license.
You can contact me on my mobile 312-543-0998 .

Best Regards,

John G. Sotos
Director, Western US & Canada

PKWARE, Inc. -
Mobile: 312-543-0998

www.pkware.com

SecureZiP Reader is now available on Apple® iTunes® and Google Play!

From: Larry Hosty (Procurement) [mailto:larry.hosty@cookcountyil.gov]
Sent: Thursday, August 29, 2013 9:25 AM

To: John Sotos

Cc: Cynthia Park (Bureau of Technology); Dionna Brookens (Procurement)
Subject: Pk software maintenance

Good Morning John ‘
I have requests for PO’s for maintenance of some of your software. | believe the County has several programs from your
company all with different renewal dates and prices. These should be consolidated into one contract for simplicity. For

starters could you list the products dates and prices and send them to me? So we can see what we are up against and
start from there.

Thank You
Larry Hosty
312-603-3951



